RNI No. MAHBIL /2009/37831

¥ ¢, 3w <9 HZAR, A W, 0IR/ATNE ¥, F ¥ [7 3, fFwa : 30 R.00

AMTYRTT HHIE ¥R
Tferha WRTITA

TERTE JMEAH TeRTE Afafawiaa Tar delet
(¥ T, TH-F AT TH-o7 TR AMHE Hholdl a7 T AR TATRET) aw o .

EgA 9 o faumT
HATET, TSI SHTHT JH, gATedT ISTE =i,
Hag woo 03X, fHH & TeT R033.

SIbEeE

WERTE WHIT Wede Hfedl, REE.

ST STHA-R0RY/T3. 290 /-2 — HERTE ST Hedot HigdT, 1]&& (268 =1 Wel. 3. ¥2) =1 Fotd 33¢ 0T
HOTH Q3T 3T TS hIUATT STeAedT USRI & wered 0 0T ek T SMUhR AT e “ TR STHH
Hegel (WEERR S1-3 S0T TSUZH TG Sholodl ST TRTFeRR -2 Tl Saiia or) oM, Q087 reed Gerom
FHIUITAIST AT 3. 1 FaHien Yeict HgeT S Hied=a Hetd 3R =1, Uie-Hherd () FR Tevaeh STACAHI, ER
T AEIATATAT TG 3o A HeKATAT Hieciaa! Ueg H0a ad 3T 37T 3l AR Ivard ad 3T i,
T FRT ¥ 3R R0%R TsH Fohall MR HeRTE WM TaamTd 2Eet.

R I HEEA W IR SRy WORTE W SR qE Aol (Feen), Wegel of o forw,
HIZTH ST AT, §ATCHT TSHE w1, HAer, HaE ¥oo 03R, Frdehe aRkIct [§-TehTgal JoT=4T/3Te BI0T=a e<ehdl {ohall o]
I TR Het.

framn AwET

Q. A1 FAHiAT, “ HeRTE STHIM Hedget (SHTERER a-R 31T AU TS shotedl SHAT HRTEeRR -2 He SieRid
T (YEROT) T35, 013 7 31 @O,

®
T TR-T—3%’-%



R HERTE JITEF AT SAGLRTT WRT TE-F, T &, J033/3ATNE ¥, Ih LY ¥
. “MERTY T Fegd (MMEERER -3 ST HISUga Ya hefedl STH HRTERER af-2 Tl SRl o)
T, R0%R 7 Wefier o shHih 3 =T 3 AW ¥ WHier qecaTed qRIGTHIuT RO FRUAT I 3 i —
(37) uftess (3)
(i) YoM T () AefeT SiSehme “ A= a9 7 Uast « T 9y 7 3T aravad .
(ii) T AT (%) et edehmed “ dfF o ” Ut “ o ay ” S SrEard A,

(=) a==T ()
(1) THMT AT (3) TfeT FUehme “ diF o ” Uestl “ arg a9 ? 31 ST a7,
(i1) T I (%) Jedier MU “ diF a8 ” Barsit “ e a9 ? 3 ar=vard 979,

HERTSZTe TSAUTe e SRER F AT,

TR 0T,
IEATY T,



HERTZ ITHA I0T SARERTT WRT TR-F, T &, 0IR/ATNE ¥, IH LYY 3

REVENUE AND FORESTS DEPARTMENT

Mantralaya, Madam Cama Marg, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk,
Mumbai 400 032, dated the 5th July 2022.

NOTIFICATION

ManarasHTRA LanD REVENUE CobE, 1966.

No. Jamin-2021/C.R. 170/J-1.— The following draft of rules to amend the Maharashtra Land
Revenue (Conversion of Occupancy Class-II and Leasehold lands into Occupancy Class-I lands)
Rules, 2019, which the Government of Maharashtra proposes to make in exercise of the powers
conferred by section 29A and 328 of the Maharashtra Land Revenue Code, 1966 (Mah. XLI of 1966)
and of all other powers enabling it in that behalf is hereby published as required by sub-section (1)
of section 329 of the said Code, for information of all the persons likely to be affected thereby ; and
notice is hereby given that the said draft will be taken into consideration by the Government of
Maharashtra on or after the 4th August 2022.

2. Any objection or suggestion which may be received by the Additional Chief Secretary to
Government of Maharashtra, Revenue and Forests Department, Mantralaya, Madam Cama Marg,
Hutatma Rajguru Chowk, Mumbai 400 032 from any person with respect to the said draft on or
before the aforesaid date will be considered by the Government.

DRAFT RULES
1. These rules may be called the Maharashtra Land Revenue (Conversion of Occupancy

Class-II and Leasehold lands into Occupancy Class-I lands) (Amendment) Rules, 2022.

2. In rule 3 of the Maharashtra Land Revenue (Conversion of Occupancy Class-II and
Leasehold lands into Occupancy Class-I lands) Rules, 2019, in sub-rule (4) in the Table,—

(a) in paragraph (A),—

(i) in column (3), in the heading for the words “three years” the words “five years”
shall be substituted ;

(i) in column (4), in the heading for the words “three years” the words “five years”
shall be substituted ;
(b) in paragraph (B),—

(i) in column (3) in the heading for the words “three years” the words “five years”
shall be substituted ;

(i) in column (4) in the heading for the words “three years” the words “five years”
shall be substituted.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAMESH CHAVAN,
Joint Secretary to Government.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



